PETROLEUM BULK PROCUREMENT AGENCY
EVALUATED BID FOR DELIVERY OF PETROLEUM PRODUCTS IN THE MONTH OF FEBRUARY 2021

Discharge point Cl1-SPM C2-SPM_ | C3-SPM | C1-KOJ1 | C2-KOJl | C3-KOJl C4-KOJ1 C-KOJ1
Product Gasoil Gasoil Gasoil Mogas Mogas Mogas Mogas Jet A-1&IK
Quantity in MT 96,428 92,280 87,732 38,169 31,572 34,692 32,098 38,770

Price basis

Average European Marketscan Platt’s Quotation for the month of January, 2021 (01st January, 2021 to
31st January, 2021); under the quote ‘Mean Fob Arab Gulf for Gasoil 0.005% S’; Mean FOB Med for
unleaded 10 ppm’; Mean FOB Arab Gulf for Jet A-1 & Ik

Bidders DAP DAP DAP DAP DAP DAP DAP DAP
Premium Premium | Premium | Premium | Premium | Premium Premium Premium
Usd/Mt Usd/Mt Usd/Mt Usd/Mt Usd/Mt Usd/Mt Usd/Mt Usd/Mt
SAHARA ENERGY RESOURCES LIMITED 39.100 38.800 39.000 39.900 NO BID NO BID 39.900 44.700
ADDAX ENERGY SA 37.800 37.600 38.700 40.500 40.910 41.000 41.000 44,900
TOTSA TOTAL OIL TRADING SA NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID NO BID - NO BID
VITOL BAHRAIN EC NO BID 38.520 38.260 NO BID NO BID NO BID 42.870 44.100
TRAFIGURA PTE LIMITED NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID NO BID - NO BID
HAPCO FZE - - - NO BID - - - -
ALCHEMIST ENERGY TRADING DMCC - - - - 39.300 39.300 - -

Discharge point PBPA/CPP/COMBI/DAR ES SALAAM & PBPA/CPP/COMBI/TANGA/02/2021
MTWARA/02/2021
Price basis Average European Marketscan Platt’s Quotation for the month of December, 2020 (015t December,
2020 to 31st December, 2020); under the quote ‘Mean Fob Arab Gulf for Gasoil 0.005% S’; Mean
FOB Med for unleaded 10 ppm’
Product Gasoil Mogas Gasoil Mogas
Mtwara Dar es Mtwara Tanga
Weighted Salaam
Quantity in MT Avegi‘age 1,000 34,712 1,500 15,050 10,800
B1§ders . Premium DAP . DAP Premium Weighted .
Price basis Premium Usd/Mt for Mogas A DAP Premium
verage
Usd/Mt for p . Usd/Mt
. remium
Gasoil
SAHARA ENERGY RESOURCES LIMITED 52.000 52.000 52.000 52.000 43.000 43.000 43.000
ADDAX ENERGY SA 54.000 54.000 54.000 54.000 45.300 45.300 45.300
TOTSA TOTAL OIL TRADING SA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
VITOL BAHRAIN EC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 45.460 42.130 50.100
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Discharge point

PBPA/CPP/COMBI/DAR ES SALAAM &
MTWARA/02/2021

PBPA/CPP/COMBI/TANGA/02/2021

Price basis

Average European Marketscan Platt’s Quotation for the month of December, 2020 (015t December,
2020 to 315t December, 2020); under the quote ‘Mean Fob Arab Gulf for Gasoil 0.005% S’; Mean
FOB Med for unleaded 10 ppm’

Product Gasoil Mogas Gasoil | Mogas
Mtwara Dar es Mtwara Tanga
Weighted Salaam
Quantity in MT Avegl{a e 1,000 34,712 1,500 15,050 | 10,800
Bidders g DAP DAP Premium :
. . Premium . Weighted .
Price basis Premium Usd/Mt for Mogas A DAP Premium
verage
Usd/Mt for p : Usd/Mt
- remium
Gasoil
TRAFIGURA PTE LIMITED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HAPCO FZE WITHDRAWN NO BID NO BID NO BID 42.353 37.030 49.7170
ALCHEMIST ENERGY TRADING DMCC - - - - - - -

Key Note: Lowest Premium |:|

SUMMARY OF THE WINNERS FOR FEBRUARY 2021 DELIVERY

Tender Number Winner Delivery date range

PBPA/CPP/C1-AGO/SPM/02/2021 ADDAX ENERGY SA 03RD - 0B™ FEBRUARY, 2021
PBPA/CPP/C2-AGO/SPM/02/2021 ADDAX ENERGY SA 12TH - 14TH FEBRUARY, 2021
PBPA/CPP/C3-AGO/SPM/02/2021 VITOL BAHRAIN EC 215T - 23RD FEBRUARY, 2021

PBPA/CPP/PMS/C1-KQOJ1/02/2021

SAHARA ENERGY RESOURCES LIMITED

10TH- 12TH FEBRUARY, 2021

PBPA/CPP/PMS/C2-KOJ1/02/2021

ALCHEMIST ENERGY TRADING DMCC

15TH - 17TH FEBRUARY, 2021

PBPA/CPP/PMS/C3-KOJ1/02/2021

ALCHEMIST ENERGY TRADING DMCC

27T - 01T MARCH, 2021

PBPA/CPP/PMS/C4-KOJ1/02/2021

SAHARA ENERGY RESOURCES LIMITED

O3FD - 05™ MARCH, 2021

PBPA/CPP/JETA-1&IK/KOJ1/02/2021

VITOL BAHRAIN EC

23RD - 25TH FEBRUARY, 2021

PBPA/CPP/COMBI/DAR ES SALAAM & MTWARA/02/2021

SAHARA ENERGY RESOURCES LIMITED

19TH - 215T FEBRUARY, 2021

PBPA/CPP/COMBI/TANGA/02/2021

HAPCO FZE

20TH- 22ND FEBRUARY, 2021




